
 

Choosing Your Friends
By Shannon Ford on May 10, 2024

TODAY'S READING: Psalm 119:41-72

The Word of God is mentioned in all but three of the 176 verses of Psalm 119. The
message is clear. God has revealed Himself in scripture, and only in that revelation can
one find forgiveness, life, and meaning. And as His followers, we are to love the Word of
God, read it, meditate on it, and seek to obey it. If the Bible does not change our values, it
will not change our lives.

Today, I want to focus on a verse in our passage that stands out and is worth discussing.
The psalmist says that the Word of God pertains to our friendships. In Psalm 119:63 we
read, I am a friend to all who fear you, to all who follow your precepts. God’s Word should
guide us in our choice of friends and associates. The most important test of our close
friends should be their attitudes toward the Bible. Do they accept it? Do they receive the
Word of God as truth? Do they fear God with a reverential awe and love for Him? We
should not make close friendships with those who do not love the Lord, do not have faith
in Jesus Christ and reject Jesus. These are the people we should pray for, share Christ
with, and show them the love of Christ.

All of us enjoy having friends. We need them. God intended for His people to enjoy close
friendships with other Christians. The believer should want to be with other believers. If we
love God, we will love His people. If I am in a right relationship to God through His Word, I
will be in a right relationship with people. My friends will be God’s friends. God never
intended us to exist in isolation. We were meant for each other. Friendships are
investments of our time and other resources. Make them count for eternity. Choose your
close friends carefully.

PRAYER: Lord, thank You for our close friends that are a blessing to us. We have many
acquaintances but few real, close friends. Thank You for the godly friendships we have
that enrich our lives and honor You. Amen.

TOMORROW'S READING: Weekend is for catch-up and review.
MONDAY'S READING: Psalm 119:73-104

Copyright © 2024 First Baptist Church, Fort Mill, SC, All rights reserved.

Visit our website

5/10/24, 8:36 AM Constant Contact

https://app.constantcontact.com/pages/campaigns/view/list 1/2

http://www.fbcfm.com/


First Baptist Church | (803)547-2051 | 121 Monroe White St., Fort Mill, SC 29715 | fbcfm.com

First Baptist Church Fort Mill | 121 Monroe White St., Fort Mill, SC 29715

Unsubscribe nfinch@fbcfm.com

Update Profile | Constant Contact Data Notice

Sent by fbc@firstbaptistchurchfortmill.ccsend.com powered by

Try email marketing for free today!

5/10/24, 8:36 AM Constant Contact

https://app.constantcontact.com/pages/campaigns/view/list 2/2

http://www.constantcontact.com/legal/about-constant-contact
mailto:fbc@firstbaptistchurchfortmill.ccsend.com
http://www.constantcontact.com/landing1/vr/home?cc=nge&utm_campaign=nge&rmc=VF21_CPE&utm_medium=VF21_CPE&utm_source=viral&pn=ROVING&nav=273c2d62-2cd7-462d-b189-abe9b92665db
http://www.constantcontact.com/landing1/vr/home?cc=nge&utm_campaign=nge&rmc=VF21_CPE&utm_medium=VF21_CPE&utm_source=viral&pn=ROVING&nav=273c2d62-2cd7-462d-b189-abe9b92665db
http://www.constantcontact.com/landing1/vr/home?cc=nge&utm_campaign=nge&rmc=VF21_CPE&utm_medium=VF21_CPE&utm_source=viral&pn=ROVING&nav=273c2d62-2cd7-462d-b189-abe9b92665db

