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Summary of Mark 4:35-5:43

Jesus Has All Authority

Mark 4:35-41 Jesus calms the sea

Mark 5:1-20  Jesus heals the Demoniac

Mark 5:21-43 Jesus heals illnesses

Jesus Goes To “The Other Side”

Mark 4:35-36 On that day, when evening 
came, He said to them, “Let us go over to the 
other side.” Leaving the crowd, they took Him 
along with them in the boat, just as He was; 
and other boats were with Him. 
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Jesus Sleeps During The Storm

Mark 4:37-38 And there arose a fierce gale of 
wind, and the waves were breaking over the 
boat so much that the boat was already filling 
up. Jesus Himself was in the stern, asleep on 
the cushion; and they woke Him and said to 
Him, “Teacher, do You not care that we are 
perishing?” 

Jesus Models Trust In God

Psalm 3:5 I lay down and slept; I awoke, for the 
Lord sustains me. 

Psalm 4:8 In peace I will both lie down and 
sleep, For You alone, O Lord, make me to 
dwell in safety. 

Proverbs 3:24 When you lie down, you will not 

be afraid; when you lie down, your sleep will 
be sweet. 

Believers Must Not Worry!

Mark 4:18-19 And others are the ones on whom 
seed was sown among the thorns; these are 
the ones who have heard the word, but the 
worries of the world, and the deceitfulness of 
riches, and the desires for other things enter in 
and choke the word, and it becomes unfruitful. 
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Cast Your Cares Upon Him

1 Peter 5:6-7 Therefore humble yourselves 
under the mighty hand of God, that He may 
exalt you at the proper time, casting all your 
anxiety on Him, because He cares for you. 

Jesus Is God

Mark 4:39 And He got up and rebuked the 
wind and said to the sea, “Hush, be still.” And 

the wind died down and it became perfectly 
calm. 

Mark 1:25 And Jesus rebuked him, saying, “Be 
quiet, and come out of him!”

Jesus Is God

Psalm 89:9 You rule the swelling of the sea; 
when its waves rise, You still them.   

Psalm 107:29-30 He caused the storm to be 
still, so that the waves of the sea were 
hushed. Then they were glad because they 
were quiet, so He guided them to their desired 
haven.
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Jesus: The “God-Man”

Mark 4:38 – “asleep” = Human nature

Mark 4:39 – “Hush, be still” = Divine nature

Jesus = 1 person with 2 natures: human/divine

Distinguish – yes                          

Separate – no

Jesus: The “God-Man”

Matthew 24:36 But of that day and hour no one 
knows, not even the angels of heaven, nor the 
Son, but the Father alone. 

John 21:17 And he said to Him, “Lord, You 
know all things; You know that I love You.” 

They Don’t Understand Who Jesus Is

Mark 4:40 And He said to them, “Why are you 
afraid? How is it that you have no faith?”

Mark 4:11 “To you has been given the mystery 

of the kingdom of God, but those who are 
outside get everything in parables…” 

Mark 8:29 “But who do you say that I am?” 
Peter answered and said to Him, “You are the 
Christ.”
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The Disciples Are Not Relieved!

Mark 4:41 They became very much afraid and 
said to one another, “Who then is this, that 
even the wind and the sea obey Him?”

This Christ Will Receive You

John 6:37 All that the Father gives Me will come 
to Me, and the one who comes to Me I will 

certainly not cast out.


