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WAIVER OF LIABILITY.  By entering Net Results 
you are recognizing that attending sporting events 
carries some risk of bodily injury or loss of or 
damage to personal property.  Person 
nevertheless voluntarily assumes all risks and 
danger incidental to attending the event for which 
the person has entered Net Results for himself 
and any minor children attending with him.  
Whether occurring prior to, during or after the 
event, person voluntarily agrees to waive any 
claims against the event management, the facility, 
and all of their respective directors, agents and 
employees arising from attending the event and 
expressly releases the event management, the 
facility, and all of their respective directors, agents 
and employees from liability for any bodily injury 
to himself, to his minor children or to his personal 
property that may occur. 
 
ADMISSION POLICY.  Admission is by 
permission of the event management.  
Management reserves the right to refuse 
admission to or eject any person for any reason it 
sees fit. 


